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OBJECTIVE
Examine how music factors (such as pitch, rhythm, and timbre)
and cognitive factors (such as working memory, WM) are
associated with better SIN outcomes in older adults with HAs.

FINDINGS

There was a statistically significant correlation between pitch and
SIN perception, Kendall τb = .187, p = .048

There was a statistically significant correlation between on-beat
rhythm and SIN, Kendall τb = -.263, p = .046

METHODS
Participants: Forty-two adults aged between 57 and 90 years (M =
73.5 years, 28 female and 14 male) with a moderate/moderately-
severe bilateral hearing loss (M = 46.9 dB HL4fPTA).

Materials: Montreal Cognitive Assessment (MoCA), Frequency
Difference Limens (FDL), Beat Alignment Test (BAT), and
QuickSIN.
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INTRODUCTION
Deafness and hearing loss affects more than 1.5 billion people
globally, and ~1 million Canadians. Hearing aids (HAs) are the
primary solution for mild to moderate sensorineural hearing loss
and effectively improve listening and quality of life. However,
HAs are of limited use in complex acoustic environments such as
in the presence of noise. Better speech-in-noise (SIN) perception
is positively associated with HA satisfaction1.
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CONCLUSION
These findings suggest pitch, on-beat rhythm, and WM support
SIN perception for older adult HA users. Although the association
between rhythm and SIN has been found in young adults with
normal hearing3; to the best of our knowledge, this has not been
reported for older adults with HAs.

FINDINGS

As expected2, there was a statistically significant correlation
between WM and SIN perception, r(40) = -.651, p < .001.
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